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Jan Price, RN, BSN, MSA, CAISS 

Jan is a retired nurse educator. She received a 
Bachelor of Science in nursing from the University of 
Rochester and a Master’s in Science in Health Services 
Administration from Central Michigan University. She 
served in the US Navy Nurse Corps during the Vietnam 
Conflict. She taught nursing at Grant Hospital School 
of Nursing and developed the Level I trauma program 
and LifeFlight helicopter program at Grant. In 1997 
she moved to Waco, Texas where she helped to 
establish a Level II trauma program at Hillcrest Baptist 
Medical Center. She has published articles and 
presented many papers on a wide variety of trauma 
topics. 

She is a member of ATS, AAAM and TETRA. Jan was 
the first Technical Coordinator for Injury Scaling until 
retiring in 2015.  She oversaw development of the 
online version of the Injury Scaling Course as well as 
the certification program for Abbreviated Injury Scale 
Specialists (CAISS). 

Jan has been AIS faculty since 1998 and is enjoying 
semi-retirement by gardening, reading and riding her 
Missouri Fox Trotter, Diamond Rio, on trails around 
central Texas. She is married to a retired Army officer 
and helicopter pilot, Murray, and they have 3 children 
and 5 grandchildren.  
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